NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS BID TABULATION 2026-H-005 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HAULING OF BASE MATERIALS

Per Loaded Ton Flat Rate Charge (Hr)
Vendor Barnto | Delive | pejivery
Company # of Sight/Ven | ry | Limitatio| Min/Max Qty. Pct. #3 Pct. #3 Pct. #3 | Pct. #3
Name Trucks dor PIT | Time ns per Ton/Truck Pct #1 Pct. #2 Richland Dawson Pct. #4 Pct #1 | Pct. #2 | Richland | Dawson| Pct. #4
Gillen Trucking 1 day .
Danny Gillen | 1-5 or Unlimited | Bam to Site | Varies | advance | 2 O m'a'; 24 Tn N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A | $ 125.00 | $12500 | $ 125.00 | $ 125.00 | § 125.00
903-641-2703 notice

Big Creek/Groesbeck $1 238; f’sgf 145 13.00 | § 10.50 12.00 13.00 NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A
Knife River/Groesbeck $12$8; g"sgf 145 13.00 | $ 10.50 12.00 13.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Connars/Mexia $12$8; :;E.s gf 145 13.00 | § 10.50 12.00 13.00 N/A NIA NIA N/A N/A
Cemex/Blum L :':fsosa; f‘ of 18.00 | $ 18.50 13.00 13.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
HMAT/Groesbeck $12$81‘ f‘sgf as 13.00 | $ 10.50 12.00 13.00 N/A | No Bid NIA N/A N/A
Martin Marietta/Corsicana $ 9.00 1000 | § 9.00 10.00 10.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Texas Bit/Malakoff NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID| NOBID| NOBID NOBID | NOBID NO BID
Big Creek/Corsicana (Hot Mix) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID NO BID




NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS BID TABULATION 2026-H-005 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HAULING OF BASE MATERIALS

Per Loaded Ton Flat Rate Charge (Hr)
Vendor Barnto |Delive | pejivery
Company # of Sight/Ven ry | Limitatio| Min/Max Qty. Pct. #3 Pct. #3 Pct. #3 | Pct. #3
Name Trucks dor PIT | Time ns per Ton/Truck Pct #1 Pct. #2 Richland Dawson Pct. #4 Pct #1 | Pct. #2 | Richland | Dawson| Pct. #4
Watson
Trucking Joey -y " No min - No Max $0.23 Per ton $0.23 Per ton $0.23 Per ton $0.23 Per ton $0.23 Per ton
Watson Unlimited Barn to Site Any NONE (Any) File fiile ille mile mile $ 125.00 | $125.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 125.00
254-205-2055
Big Creek/Groesbeck $ 11.75 1225 | $ 9.00 10.00 12.00 | $ 125.00 | $125.00 [ $ 125.00 | $ 125.00 [ $ 125.00
Knife River/Groesbeck $ 11.75 1225 9.00 10.00 12.00 | $ 125.00 | $125.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 125.00 [ $ 125.00
Connors/Mexia $ 12.00 1275 | $ 9.90 10.75 12,50 [ $ 125.00 | $125.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 125.00
Cemex/Blum $ 17.50 2125 | % 20.50 15.50 1525 | $ 125.00 [ $125.00 [ $ 125.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 125.00
HMAT/Groesbeck $ 1.75 1250 | $ 9.25 10.25 12.50 | $ 125.00 | $125.00 [ $ 125.00 | $ 125.00 | $§ 125.00
Martin Marietta/Corsicana $ 7.00 925 | $ 7.00 10.00 12.00 [ $ 125.00 | $125.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 125.00
Texas Bit/Malakoff (Hot Mix) $ 11.50 7.00 | $ 12.00 14.00 12.50 | $ 125.00 [ $125.00 [ $ 125.00 | $ 125.00 | § 125.00
Big Creek/Corsicana (Hot Mix) $ 7.00 975 | $ 7.00 10.00 12.00 | $ 125.00 [ $125.00 [ $ 12500 | $ 125.00 | § 125.00




NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS BID TABULATION 2026-H-005 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HAULING OF BASE MATERIALS

Per Loaded Ton Flat Rate Chg?e {Hr)
Vendor Barn to | Delive | pejivery
Company # of Sight/Ven ry | Limitatio| Min/Max Qty. Pct. #3 Pct. #3 Pct. #3 | Pct. #3
Name Trucks dor PIT | Time ns per Ton/Truck Pct #1 Pct. #2 Richland Dawson Pct. #4 Pct #1 | Pct. #2 [ Richland | Dawson| Pct. #4
Roads
Transportation in -
Group Nicole 10+ Barn to Site 2;48 none | 20 T?"s MN'I" 20 9.25 925 | $ 9.25 9.25 9.25 | $ 12500 | $125.00 | $ 125.00 [ $ 125.00 | $ 125.00
White S ons Max
936-577-1573
Big Creek/Groesbeck 9.50 950 | $ 9.50 9.50 9.50 | $ 125.00 | $125.00 [ $ 12500 | $ 125.00 | $ 125.00
Knife River/Groesbeck 9.50 950 | $ 9.50 9.50 9.50 | $ 125.00 | $125.00 [ $ 125.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 125.00
Connors/Mexia 10.00 10.00 | $ 10.00 10.00 10.00 | $ 125.00 | $125.00 [ $ 125.00 | $ 125.00 [ $ 125.00
Cemex/Blum 16.00 16.00 | $ 16.00 16.00 16.00 [ $ 125.00 | $125.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 12500 | § 125.00
HMAT/Groesbeck 10.00 10.00 | $ 10.00 10.00 10.00 | $ 125.00 | $125.00 [ $ 12500 { $ 125.00 | $§ 125.00
Martin Marietta/Corsicana 9.25 925 | $ 9.25 9.25 9.25 | $ 12500 | $125.00 | $ 12500 | $ 12500 | $ 125.00
Big Creek/Corsicana (Hot Mix) 13.00 13.00 | $ 13.00 13.00 13.00 | $ 125.00 [ $125.00 [ $ 125.00 | $ 125.00 | § 125.00




NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS BID TABULATION 2026-H-005 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HAULING OF BASE MATERIALS

Per Loaded Ton Flat Rate Chargg(Hr)
Vendor Barnto |Delive | pejivery
Company # of Sight/Ven ry | Limitatio| Min/Max Qty. Pct. #3 Pct. #3 Pct. #3 | Pct. #3
Name Trucks dor PIT | Time ns per Ton/Truck Pct #1 Pct. #2 Richland Dawson Pct. #4 Pct #1 [ Pct. #2 | Richland [ Dawson| Pct. #4
D & T Services i
Dana Hicks Unlimited | BamtoSite | Varies | NoNE |Z0Onemin-25tons | ¢ 12,00 | $ 18.00 | $ 1025 | 8 12.25 | § 12.00 | $ 12500 | NOBID |$ 9500 | $ 9500{$ 12500
254-715-9718
Big Creek (Groesbeck) $ 1200 | $ 18.00 | $ 1025 | $ 1225 | $ 12.00 | $ 125.00 | NOBID | $ 125.00 | § 125.00 | § 125.00
Knife River (Groesbeck) $ 12.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 1025 | $ 1225 | $ 12.00 | $ 125.00 | $125.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 125.00 | § 125.00
$13
Connors (Mexia) *PCT1.| $ 18.00 | $ 1025 | § 1225 | § 12.00 | $ 125.00 | $125.00 | $ 12500 | § 12500 [ $ 125.00
{Whitney)- $15
Cemex (Blum) $ 1520 | 1750 | $ 17.50 | $ 1225 | $ 1250 | $ 125.00 | NOBID | $ 125.00 | § 125.00 [ $ 125.00
HMAT (Groesbeck) $ 13.00 | $ 18.00 | § 1025 | $ 1225 | 12.00 | $ 125.00 | NOBID | $ 125.00 | $ 125.00 [ $ 125.00
Martin Marietta (Corsicana) $ 750 | § 9.00 | § 9.00 | $ 1000 | § 8.00 | $ 125.00 | $12500 | $ 12500 | $ 125.00 | $ 125.00
Texas Bit (Hot Mix - Malakoff) $ 12.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $ 125.00 | NOBID NOBID | NOBID NO BID
Big Creek (Hot Mix - Corsicana) $ 1000 | § 18.00 | $ 1050 | § 1225 | $ 12.00 | $ 125.00 | NOBID | $§ 125.00 | § 125.00 [ § 125.00




